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Follow up
3 messages

Aled Lewis <aled.lewis@fawtrust.cymru> 16 January 2020 at 15:31
To: Llangennech AFC Committee <committee@llangennechafc.org>
Cc: Ceri Richards <ceri.richards@sport.wales>

Hi Em,

Good to catch up earlier, here’s the details of CAVS particularly around funding support.

http://www.cavs.org.uk/funding-advice/

Also, managed to get clarification from Caroline that either a licence or a lease would be acceptable as secure tenure
as long as there was written confirmation in place from the owner or freeholder that detailed the term of the
agreement.

Thanks

Aled
Aled Lewis
Football Development Manager - Club Accreditation
FAW Trust

Tel: +44 (0) 1633 282 911
Mob: +44 (0) 7387 027 932
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wybodaeth sy'n eiddo’| Ymddiriedolaeth Gymdeithas Bél-droed Cymru a allai fod yn freintiedig neu'n gyfrinachol. Fe'i

wriedir dim ond at ddefn%dd r unigolyn/unigolion neu'r endid a enwir uchod. Os nad chi yw'r derbynnydd
arfaethedig, sylwer y gwaherddir datgelu, copio, dosbarthu neu ddefnyddio’r wybodaeth hon. Os ch wedi derbyn
yr e-bost hwn drwy gamgymeriad, rhowch wybod imi ar unwaith ar y cyfeiriad e-bost uchod. Diolch. Rydym yn monitro
ein system e-bost'a’'gallem gofnodi'ch e-byst.

FAW Trust/Ymddiriedolaeth Cymdeithas Bél Droed Cymruy
4R|Sg\|stered office/Swyddfa gofrestredig: Dragon Park, National Football Development Centre, NISV, Newport, NP19

Company registration no/Rhif cofrestru'r cwmni: 00213349
Charity registration no/Rhif cofrestru'r elusen: 1057856

Llangennech AFC Committee <committee@llangennechafc.org> 21 January 2020 at 22:13
To: Aled Lewis <aled.lewis@fawtrust.cymru>
Cc: Ceri Richards <ceri.richards@sport.wales>

Gents

Apologies for the delay in responding. Yes, it was a very worthwhile discussion on Thursday and thank you both for
your time. As discussed, I'll keep you informed of developments with other grant applications too Cer!


http://www.cavs.org.uk/funding-advice/
https://www.fawtrust.cymru/
tel:+44%20(0)%201633%20282%20911
tel:+44%20(0)%207387%20027%20932
https://twitter.com/FAWTrust
https://www.facebook.com/FAWTrust
https://www.instagram.com/fawales
https://www.linkedin.com/company/welsh-football-trust
https://www.youtube.com/user/WelshFootballT

Al, I have contacted CAVS this evening and bcc'd you in. Aviva community and PostCode Local Trust applications
open today so been doing some preparation for that, I'll await any advice from CAVS - as Ceri suggested - before |
send in the applications. Great ews on the license issue Al, just a quick one on the condition stating "sufficient
reassurance being provided on how the asset would be protected”. What exactly are they looking for? A statement
regarding the general lock up of the Park at night or something more specific like CCTV, fencing? | had a quote for
80m of spectator fencing on 2 sides for £12k!?

Let me know mate, so | can form a reply in plenty of time prior to the Feb 20 deadline. Give me a ring if you
prefer mate.

Cheers

Em
[Quoted text hidden]

Aled Lewis <aled.lewis@fawtrust.cymru> 22 January 2020 at 18:09
To: Llangennech AFC Committee <committee@llangennechafc.org>

Hi Em,
Great to hear the progress since our call.

On the condition of protection, an email detailing the access and lock up procedures to the park and where the
floodlights would be stored would be sufficient.

Thanks

Al

Sent from my iPhone

Aled Lewis
Football Development Manager - Club Accreditation
FAW Trust

Tel: +44 (0) 1633 282 911
Mob: +44 (0) 7387 027 932
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On 21 Jan 2020, at 22:13, Llangennech AFC Committee <committee@I|langennechafc.org> wrote:

Gents

Apologies for the delay in responding. Yes, it was a very worthwhile discussion on Thursday and thank
you both for your time. As discussed, I'll keep you informed of developments with other grant
applications too Cer!

Al, I have contacted CAVS this evening and bcc'd you in. Aviva community and PostCode Local Trust
applications open today so been doing some preparation for that, I'll await any advice from CAVS - as
Ceri suggested - before | send in the applications. Great ews on the license issue Al, just a quick one
on the condition stating "sufficient reassurance being provided on how the asset would be protected".
What exactly are they looking for? A statement regarding the general lock up of the Park at night or
something more specific like CCTV, fencing? | had a quote for 80m of spectator fencing on 2 sides for
£12k!?
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